

Form F: Solid Waste, Recycling, Yard Waste Cost Proposal

Responders may choose to provide proposed pricing for services from any or all of the following zones. A selected Proposer will be awarded no more than two zones.

Zone 1: Altoona, Bondurant, Clive, and Pleasant Hill (Currently 17,525 households)

The following communities may be added to zone for recycling services only: Alleman, Ankeny, Mingo, Elkhart, Hartford, Prairie City, Unincorporated Polk County, Urbandale (Added communities < 25% of the Zone household count will be at the agreed upon rate below. If >25%, will be negotiated.)

A. SOLID WASTE & RECYCLING:

Please provide the per month per household proposed rate for the services below.

	Solid Waste	Recycling (Every Other Week Collection)	Recycling (Weekly Collection)	Solid Waste Alternate w/out Recycling*
96-gal cart	= \$. /HH/MO 9.76	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID
48-gal cart	= \$. /HH/MO 9.31	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID
96-gal extra cart	= \$. /HH/MO 9.26	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID
48-gal extra cart	= \$. /HH/MO 8.81	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID
Spring cleanup	= \$. /HH/MO .55			= \$. /HH/MO NO BID

* Solid Waste Alternate w/out Recycling: per household cost in the event recycling collection procured as a separate contract based on Zone 7.

Additional Services	
- Excessive Cardboard Pick-up	= \$ 20.00/Trip
- Late Set Out Return Service	= \$ 10.00/Trip
- Extra cart collection (outside regular collection schedule)	= \$ 20.00/Trip
- Additional proposed:	

B. YARD WASTE

Yard Waste price per Ton	= \$. /Ton 165.00
--------------------------	-----------------------

Zone 2: Carlisle, West Des Moines, Windsor Heights (Currently 17,940 households)

The following communities may be added to zone for recycling services only: Alleman, Ankeny, Mingo, Elkhart, Hartford, Prairie City, Unincorporated Polk County, Urbandale (Added communities < 25% of the Zone household count will be at the agreed upon rate below. If >25%, will be negotiated.)

C. SOLID WASTE & RECYCLING:

Please provide the per month per household proposed rate for the services below.

	Solid Waste	Recycling (Every Other Week Collection)	Recycling (Weekly Collection)	Solid Waste Alternate w/out Recycling*
96-gal cart	= \$. /HH/MO 9.77	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID
48-gal cart	= \$. /HH/MO 9.32	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID
96-gal extra cart	= \$. /HH/MO 9.27	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID
48-gal extra cart	= \$. /HH/MO 8.82	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID
Spring cleanup	= \$. /HH/MO .55			= \$. /HH/MO NO BID

* Solid Waste Alternate w/out Recycling: per household cost in the event recycling collection procured as a separate contract based on Zone 7.

Additional Services	
- Excessive Cardboard Pick-up	= \$ 20.00/Trip
- Late Set Out Return Service	= \$ 10.00/Trip
- Extra cart collection (outside regular collection schedule)	= \$ 20.00/Trip
- Additional proposed:	

D. YARD WASTE

Yard Waste price per Ton	= \$. /Ton 165 ⁰⁰
--------------------------	----------------------------------

Zone 3: Grimes, Johnston, Mitchellville, Norwalk, Polk City, Runnels (Currently 17,976 households)

The following communities may be added to zone for recycling services only: **Alleman, Ankeny, Mingo, Elkhart, Hartford, Prairie City, Unincorporated Polk County, Urbandale** (Added communities < 25% of the Zone household count will be at the agreed upon rate below. If >25%, will be negotiated.)

E. SOLID WASTE & RECYCLING:

Please provide the per month per household proposed rate for the services below.

	Solid Waste	Recycling (Every Other Week Collection)	Recycling (Weekly Collection)	Solid Waste Alternate w/out Recycling*
96-gal cart	= \$. /HH/MO 9.76	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO No Bid	= \$. /HH/MO No Bid
48-gal cart	= \$. /HH/MO 9.31	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO No Bid	= \$. /HH/MO No Bid
96-gal extra cart	= \$. /HH/MO 9.26	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO No Bid	= \$. /HH/MO No Bid
48-gal extra cart	= \$. /HH/MO 8.81	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO No Bid	= \$. /HH/MO No Bid
Spring cleanup	= \$. /HH/MO .55			= \$. /HH/MO No Bid

* Solid Waste Alternate w/out Recycling: per household cost in the event recycling collection procured as a separate contract based on Zone 7.

Additional Services - Excessive Cardboard Pick-up - Late Set Out Return Service - Extra cart collection (outside regular collection schedule) - Additional proposed:	= \$ 20.00 /Trip = \$ 10.00 /Trip = \$ 20.00 /Trip
--	---

F. YARD WASTE

Yard Waste price per Ton	= \$. /Ton 165.00
--------------------------	------------------------------

Zone 4: Ankeny, Bondurant, Polk City (Currently 25,617 households)

The following communities may be added to zone for recycling services only: Alleman, Ankeny, Mingo, Elkhart, Hartford, Prairie City, Unincorporated Polk County, Urbandale (Added communities < 25% of the Zone household count will be at the agreed upon rate below. If >25%, will be negotiated.)

G. SOLID WASTE & RECYCLING:

Please provide the per month per household proposed rate for the services below.

	Solid Waste	Recycling (Every Other Week Collection)	Recycling (Weekly Collection)	Solid Waste Alternate w/out Recycling*
96-gal cart	= \$. /HH/MO 10.30	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO No Bio	= \$. /HH/MO No Bio
48-gal cart	= \$. /HH/MO 9.85	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO No Bio	= \$. /HH/MO No Bio
96-gal extra cart	= \$. /HH/MO 9.35	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO No Bio	= \$. /HH/MO No Bio
48-gal extra cart	= \$. /HH/MO 9.30	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO No Bio	= \$. /HH/MO No Bio
Spring cleanup	= \$. /HH/MO .55			= \$. /HH/MO No Bio

* Solid Waste Alternate w/out Recycling: per household cost in the event recycling collection procured as a separate contract based on Zone 7.

Additional Services	
- Excessive Cardboard Pick-up	= \$ 20.00 /Trip
- Late Set Out Return Service	= \$ 10.00 /Trip
- Extra cart collection (outside regular collection schedule)	= \$ 20.00 /Trip
- Additional proposed:	

H. YARD WASTE

Yard Waste price per Ton	= \$. /Ton 165.00
--------------------------	------------------------------

Zone 5: Carlisle, Clive, Mitchellville, West Des Moines, Windsor Heights (Currently 24,229 households)

The following communities may be added to zone for recycling services only: Alleman, Ankeny, Mingo, Elkhart, Hartford, Prairie City, Unincorporated Polk County, Urbandale (Added communities < 25% of the Zone household count will be at the agreed upon rate below. If >25%, will be negotiated.)

I. SOLID WASTE & RECYCLING:

Please provide the per month per household proposed rate for the services below.

	Solid Waste	Recycling (Every Other Week Collection)	Recycling (Weekly Collection)	Solid Waste Alternate w/out Recycling*
96-gal cart	= \$. /HH/MO 10.75	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID
48-gal cart	= \$. /HH/MO 10.30	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID
96-gal extra cart	= \$. /HH/MO 10.25	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID
48-gal extra cart	= \$. /HH/MO 9.80	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID	= \$. /HH/MO NO BID
Spring cleanup	= \$. /HH/MO .55			= \$. /HH/MO NO BID

* Solid Waste Alternate w/out Recycling: per household cost in the event recycling collection procured as a separate contract based on Zone 7.

Additional Services - Excessive Cardboard Pick-up - Late Set Out Return Service - Extra cart collection (outside regular collection schedule) - Additional proposed:	= \$ 20.00/Trip = \$ 10.00/Trip = \$ 20.00/Trip
--	---

J. YARD WASTE

Yard Waste price per Ton	= \$. /Ton 145.00
--------------------------	-----------------------

Zone 6: Altoona, Grimes, Johnston, Norwalk, Pleasant Hill, Runnells (Currently 24,867 households)

The following communities may be added to zone for recycling services only: Alleman, Ankeny, Mingo, Elkhart, Hartford, Prairie City, Unincorporated Polk County, Urbandale (Added communities < 25% of the Zone household count will be at the agreed upon rate below. If >25%, will be negotiated.)

K. SOLID WASTE & RECYCLING:

Please provide the per month per household proposed rate for the services below.

	Solid Waste	Recycling (Every Other Week Collection)	Recycling (Weekly Collection)	Solid Waste Alternate w/out Recycling*
96-gal cart	= \$. /HH/MO 10.45	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO No Bio	= \$. /HH/MO No Bio
48-gal cart	= \$. /HH/MO 10.00	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO No Bio	= \$. /HH/MO No Bio
96-gal extra cart	= \$. /HH/MO 9.95	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO No Bio	= \$. /HH/MO No Bio
48-gal extra cart	= \$. /HH/MO 9.50	= \$. /HH/MO 2.30	= \$. /HH/MO No Bio	= \$. /HH/MO No Bio
Spring cleanup	= \$. /HH/MO .55			= \$. /HH/MO No Bio

* Solid Waste Alternate w/out Recycling: per household cost in the event recycling collection procured as a separate contract based on Zone 7.

Additional Services	
- Excessive Cardboard Pick-up	= \$ 20.00 /Trip
- Late Set Out Return Service	= \$ 10.00 /Trip
- Extra cart collection (outside regular collection schedule)	= \$ 20.00 /Trip
- Additional proposed:	

L. YARD WASTE

Yard Waste price per Ton	= \$. /Ton 165.00
--------------------------	-----------------------

Zone 7: Alternate Cost for Stand Alone Recycling Contract

A. RECYCLING:

Please provide the per month per household proposed rate for the services below for:

Alleman, Altoona, Ankeny, Bondurant, Carlisle, Clive, Elkhart, Grimes, Hartford, Johnston, Mingo, Mitchellville, Norwalk, Pleasant Hill, Polk City, Prairie City, Runnells, Unincorporated Polk County, Urbandale, West Des Moines, Windsor Heights

	Recycling *Every Other Week Collection	Recycling *Weekly Collection
96-gal cart	= \$. /HH/MO <i>No Bid</i>	= \$. /HH/MO <i>No Bid</i>
48-gal cart	= \$. /HH/MO <i>No Bid</i>	= \$. /HH/MO <i>No Bid</i>
96-gal extra cart	= \$. /HH/MO <i>No Bid</i>	= \$. /HH/MO <i>No Bid</i>
48-gal extra cart	= \$. /HH/MO <i>No Bid</i>	= \$. /HH/MO <i>No Bid</i>

Additional Services - Excessive Cardboard Pick-up - Late Set Out Return Service - Extra cart collection (outside regular collection schedule) - Additional proposed:	<i>No Bid</i>	= \$ — /Trip = \$ — /Trip = \$ — /Trip
--	---------------	--

Fees for collection of Member Community facilities in the event collection occurs less than three business days apart.

Container Size	\$/Service
48 gallon	\$10 ⁰⁰
96 gallon	\$10 ⁰⁰
2 cubic yards	\$10 ⁰⁰
3 cubic yards	12 ⁰⁰
4 cubic yards	14 ⁰⁰
6 cubic yards	18 ⁰⁰
8 cubic yards	22 ⁰⁰